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ASU: Quick Facts and Figures

= Territorial Normal SchoolZ & & (1885)
= Arizona State Teachers College2 FA & (1929)

= Arizona State UniversityZ2 & HZ (1958)

= Carnegie R1 status &8 (1994) #1 in the U s
(R1: Doctoral Universities — Highest research activity) fOI‘ innovation

= USNWR =M 23 3H A= 19 #1 ASU #2 Stanford #3 MIT
o o . = U.5. News & World Report 2016, 2017 and 2018

= USNWR = LSt 1159 (#61 among publics)

= MA CHE =% 1269

| 1
= QS MA CHE =% 209¢
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ASU: 2017 Enrollment

= Campus Immersion > ot@| & == X[ZH| (IPEDS 2| A A= 2014)
oy 3=
gl-_l_ 60’2 38 $120.000 - In FY¥14, ASU used 20% fewer resources per degree
N ’ UCLA a:ﬁrded tdh.an the Tatiunj!jrgediar;. If sgggﬁing;"?uere
E o|._CI)__I 1 2 21 8 %e0 037 at the median, costs would have been million
H —_ L= ! $100,000 1 ;,;'; m S greater. -
= Digital Immersion S e Wae e
$50,000 - 76,561 §74,092 Wisconsin
"'I. H $69,657 Colorado ASU
T 22,934 563070 $61,223
$50,000
CHst&R 7,649
. $40,000 — — — — T HHH P HHH e HHH A H A HHH SEEEEEEETHEEE L
= |nternational students
$20,000
13,164*
50
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Arizona State
University

COLLEGES

#1°

inthe U.S.for
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#1 ASU #2 Stanford #3 MIT
- U.S. News & World Report
2016, 2017 and 2018




Education Innovation at ASU: Past, Present and Future

1. 7HEH &2l (Conceptual Innovation)
« New American University
« ASU Charter
« 5th Wave University

2. 7|2 &4l (Institutional Innovation)
« Transdisciplinary Schools
 Partnerships

3. C|XIE =4l (Digital Innovation)
« ASU Online

o eAdvisor
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Design Aspiration

1. Leverage Our Place
ASU= =%t Ar2| 8HA, 22X settingS 7+
2. Enable Students Success

ASUL ZtZto| EE3} SHMEO| MZ0| £

[ulo

=
3. Transform Society

ASUE AtR|H 20| HZ
4. Fuse Intellectual Disciplines

ASUE SIEX 212 RASIOZ N KA S AHE

Ok

o2 ALE|X HiztE ETIE
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Design Aspiration

5. Value Entrepreneurship
ASU= 11 X|AIS AFRSID HAMS Axst
6. Be Socially Embedded
ASUE AE7te| 0|22 IEHYE St SEHe AX
7. Conduct Use-Inspired Research
ASU gi7= S8 SFH = 7ta
8. Engage Globally

ASU= X[9H, H=4, oHH2 MEs1 Olfns= Hs
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ASU Charter

Charter Principles
1. Inclusion vs. exclusion

(Open and accessible to community)

2. Impact on public good

3. Responsibility for the broader community

ASU is a comprehensive public research university, measured not by whom it excludes,
but by whom it includes and how they succeed; advancing research and discovery of
public value; and assuming fundamental responsibility for the economic, social,
cuIturaI and overall health of the communities it serves.

"F1E WAL 2N FdE5t= A0| OotL|El B £8ec2M 35 + U= 2E,
11 "01I E80| &l= Ayt BEE XSts BE, SSH Q| HZa 5X| 28 OfL| 2t

3 1|, A, 22t S8 S 202 AS FE YRR 4= 2E”

m Arizona State
University



ASU Charter in Action

Metric
ASU undergraduates from Arizona from
families in the lower half of family incomes ~2% ~50%
Freshmen retention rate ~65% ~85%
Percent minority students ~15% ~50% Notes
Number of Hispanic students in freshmen
class 225 ~3,000
Number of degrees awarded ~6,200 ~24.,000
6-year graduation rate Not recorded ~70%
4-year graduation rate 13.80% >52% An 85% increase from 2002 levels
lAverage net tuition paid per year by Arizona
N ) ) resident students in 2017 in real dollars is less
Average net tuition paid by AZ residents than the net tuition paid by Arizona resident
(after considering all aid strategies) Not recorded ~5$2,000 students in 1985,
Ranked in the Top 10 of all U.5. universities
without a medical school in the U S. and
ranked among the 100 leading research
universities in the world. This translates into
more than 10,000 research projects that
provide exiraordinary opportunity and
Research funding $29M $530M experience for our students
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Restructuring financial aid model

= Grants and Scholarships Provided by ASU = ASU Tuition and Fees

£3093 458 847

34,9

£ADB00

217,386,433 Se.080

F1856485, 731
§202,563,002 R
$138,411,926 $150,812.419 -
106,654,038 .
s $121,078.818 o I

B4z 618,82 n

. EE S0air FLILE 20607 PR 200e S X111 Hrig=ad X1b1k FisEl ) 03415 201518 20 3= 17

3 k1L APt ] )
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Restructuring financial aid model

" Arizona State
University

PELL ELIGIBLE
STUDENTS
IN 2002-03

10,344

PELL ELIGIELE
STUDENTS

IN 2016-17

31,635

2016-2017

A= o dS0|
HH| stdel 329 1
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Restructuring financial aid model

. TuE tuu_ —EJEH Jk17""

We designed tuition-free programs to serve Arizona
First-Time Freshmen from Arizona

5000

4000

2000

2017-2018
o 2| =L} 92| 42%9] First-Time Freshmen
TR E WYX = =20

20300

: I I I I I |
: n 1
-E A-17

00008 10085 PR W17 WOTE HOME ;ORI Imda M 3 MBS SR

of First-Time Freshmen
from Arizona in 2017-18
were in a tuition-free
program
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Restructuring financial aid model

We are serving more student from families with lower incomes:
ASU First-Time Full-Time Freshmen Enroliment by Adjusted Family Income
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Institutional Innovation

« J|ES MEHO HB U B FAO| HAS HPEE
. CHITYSIS 'S ZH S2 SHEE SACOE M I4E FHOE INE XN o
of, 317} Ol CHStS AR M4 U B Zho| ZX0| S8}
=
-

T
= 18702 Z[HE T ==X CHEt= (transdisciplinary schools)
School of Earth & Space exploration
School for the Future of Innovation in Society

School of Civic and Economic Thought and Leadership

ﬂl’ ScHOOL OF EARTH m SHAYFUTURE %
& SPACE EXPLORATION of Innovation in Society School of Civic

and Economic
ARIZONA STATE UNIVERSITY ARIZONA STATE UNIVERSITY Thoughtand

Leadership
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Higher Education Evolution

S AIEy

innovative high risk
F'y

9

New American University

Ol= A3 s

2|2 o7t o]

» |large scale EH'H'E

Y
conservative low risk

ERR)
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Evolutionary History of American Higher Education

Greek Public American Research
Academies Colleges Land Grants University
Scale: Small Scale: Medium Scale: State Scale: Institutional Scale: Societal
Ha'\rvar d University of Georgia University of Wisconsin | Johns Hopkins New American
Pnncetsm University of Michigan Penn State Stanford University (ASU)
Bowdoin University of Virginia University of llincis University of Chicago Purdue University
University of California Harvard*
Massachusetts University of Michigan®
Institute of Technology | University of lllinois®
°
&
>
< = »
.- >
© (3 4]
1636 - 1785 - 1862 - 1876 -
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ASU'’s

What is e-Advisor?

overall commitment to ensure our students reach their academic goals and graduate
SAS0| oY SHO| 25ty Y = U=
st =0 Tl MEfE B A (monitors student progress)
2210l st& XHE XS (provides online academic resources)
SASHA == sl AS0| HF0| & A|&SHL EQ/TA| &8 Tdg = UAE=
JHEBLEl =2 AFE (uses personalized tools to advise students and ensure they get off
to a good start on day one and stay on track toward graduation)

m Arizona State
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What is e-Advisor?

Step 1: Help students identify interests
Me3: 2t T2 & X5 std=2| 7i21H el S0/0 7|25td 6071 2| O|O|X| & HF=&F St=

Compare Programs | Compare Major Maps
Accountancy Business (Global Leadership)

Alicia, discover what's right for you.

Great choices! Now compare your options in depth
to choose the best fit for you

Photographers Set and Exhibit Film and Video
Apply Now Apply Now Designers Editors
Apply Now
Marketing (Digital and Design Studies (Design Journalism and Mass.
Request Info Request Info Integrated Marketing Management) Communication
Commun...
Request Info
at If: See how your courses can be appled 10300

What If: See how your courses can be applied 1o anothes

What If: See how your courses can be appliec 10 anothe

Program Description Program Description

ﬂl Arizona State
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What is e-Advisor?

Step 1: Help students identify interests

Me3: &t T2 S R =5 stdl=9| 7HH el S0/0f 7|#35t6] 60742] O|O[X| & XF== ot=

>

|_T'_
o

5|
otEl 1530 Major map=

: 158tu £¢, Arizona F2o| CHe 3t MEISH HMIZ oM H3HQl

1%
o

i I — B |
st sH S0 Mg Melat F2 g x| g

—/ (@) L. O d
. ZIf
O= M M MAH 102 HO| H= AR}

m’ Arizona State
University 21



What is e-Advisor?

Step 2: Help students find degrees that match their interests
= Degree Search

Sds2 A50A 71 S8 7Lz oY T2 s AM5tD Huy = UAS

Arizona State ASUHome v MyASU  Colleges and Schools ¥ Map and Locations v  Directory SIGN IN
m University Search Q

Academic Programs

# Undergraduate Degrees Undergraduate Minors & Certificates Graduate Programs Resources ~

Undergraduate Degrees

Search ASU undergraduate programs for description, major
requirements, career opportunities and interest areas.

What do you want to study? What do you want to be? Where do you want to study? Additional Options
Search Degrees
Online Programs
Accelerated Programs Advanced Search
Not sure? Take these quizzes to find the degree or campus that fits you 2 -

Concurrent Programs

Sign In to save your search results for later use.
Saved Programs (0)

Explore Undergraduate Degrees By Interest

S

[ ST PR e
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What is e-Advisor?

Step 3: Chart progress towards a degree with Major Maps
Major MapO|2t?

« Major Map Outline:

> o =85 =X (&9 27 Z=Y)

> OHl ==X (2L =A)

> B8t 2ok B—TLEIE PN
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What is e-Advisor?

2018 - 2019 Major Map
Innovation in Society, BS

School/Cellege: School for the ause of Innovamon in Socsety

Lecanon: Tempe campus
FIFISBS

Step 3: Chart progress towards a degree with Major Maps

@ 115 101: SFIS: The ASU Expersence

.lh‘ 1 Welcome 0 the Y aawe

ENG 10 or ENG M Farst-Y o Composition OR
ENG 105 Advanced ¥ iyt Y car Composation OR
I \(o lﬂ’ o l \(. ow hr\l Yo Compositaon

MAT 170 Pn\‘h-hnt\!\l

Natweal Scwnce - OQuastitative (M)

Term howrs swbnotal

] L
4
4

Arizona State

University

® An SAT, ACT, Accuplacer, IELTS or
TOEFL score determunes placement
0 first-year Composiion Courses

® ASU Mathematics Placement Test
score determincs placement in
mathematics course

® ASU 101 or college-specific
equivalent First-Year Sermnar
required of all freshman students

* Joun a student club or professional
organi zation

24



What is e-Advisor?

Step 4: Automate Feedback between Student and Advisor

Q.MHOI 823t Q@ AN (requirements)S 55 5IX| £51H
SHM2 O|H YR SX|E A E

-1 O
> SHMO| TrackS B0t 11 AFER T} SIS SHA O] MY ASU &HAH | 0| K| 0] & Of RICtH= 2 X|

Re: Action Required: Review Your Tracking Status 1nbex |
® sAdvinor 1559 (0 minudes ogo) 4 Reghy | v

ASU has reviewed your progress towards completing the crtical requirements described on your Major Map. Your Major Map and progress
reports can be viewed by logging into hWip.//my. 35y, edy.

If you have an eAdvisor adwsing hold, you must contact your adwsor to have the hold released and for assistance with

reviewang your critical requirements,

determining the apphcability of courses that you may be completing 3t a community college, Priority Tasks =
discussing how you can use winter and summer sessions 10 complete any missing critical requirements, and Academics Finances
exploring success strategies HOLD: eAdvisor Hold - 2016 Fall Parent IRS Data Retrieval
Application Fee
You can contact your adwsing ofice at Ready 1o Register for Fall? Campus Services
Advising Office; Collegs of Liberal Ads and Sciences
Phone: 480/965-5095
Wob Address: http fhumancommunication clas asu eduf/undergraduate/advising shiml
We hope you're having a good semester. ASU faculty, advisors and staff are dedicated to helping you succeed—let us know howy My Programs and eAdvisor™ ?

you

s Programs Find Programs Graduation

Psychology (BS) @ Tempe - Off Track 4§

Major Map &1 My Progress Reports (DaRS)
College of Liberal Arts and Sciences Adwvising
Success Coaching

25



What is e-Advisor?

Step 5: Track Progress

The Sun Devil Tracking Status report
: Advisors2t administrationOf| 1& LHO|AM Sl 50| track on- or off-0ff et EF XS

I0E5 Fpll 15003 28
eAdvisor™ Cohort: |4 ] Waiwersity Collogs AMSllate Programi [&1 ¥ CorserMBr 0 Catess LGRD Arcagemic SUndng Gocd Suadisg 2014 Sparg 7000 2680
Enrolmesst Sanis | Ewebed Shdenis - Wi Terme (MM cpeg v G Total Howrs TR m:w“"“" R
Requirermsant Types Sanis
ol:r'xa Majr MHeceazary Win ¥ oM Ooni Trasck: o Owted [ hestams
Requiremen Requinemes! Track Track Ty e e Temd
Sun el Tracking Stats &M ;
e R = .. swesn mmd im
Siesame Gioep Seudani ] Sludanes % Sludaney = Sendenia ] Tatsl ~Effective Dats “Effective S quance Campus  TEMFE afudvtsor DEROOG LA PGSBS | [=
ol of Pul Sery & Coren Soliing. M R e 0% n ] o 20 N N [T T—] N
Cotege of Leners b Scincea e | 2am TR : e eI EvabuinciPlen  LPGIER  Pecimiony - T Calby'tiar 24 Juwver  Ravivond o
Cranks Schaoh JourmansConm T T TY W A T ¥ oors 1,373 Erakasted Seboln St X oY Track
Hasah Solutiorg i34 BN M2 MEw H 16N n ] 37
r———— 1381 | TTe 3| 3w YT N I
k3 & Pyl Engmeering ATEE  BLE% 4068 ATSW L1} 0% ™ 0 B0 Carvent Tiach Tarm 4 Fagdan v L ormmamil
Liseral 443 & Seences AT TOTH T IR [T Esshuson Term 2381
MaryLoeFalise Taschar Cobsge T WL 2ams - AT 1 0% 1,37
s Indgvnie Aris & Boevoes 241 TOIM 4ET | 25.4% N % ¥ 1M 1,767 P Expard ail
taraeg & Healh leevstee T s N 4 nss ne| inEs 180 rack term 1 (D4 Crem Meurs
el of Thogal Man ansme L] 1] 4%% § T LA L I e e e |
St o Sueib abdity e B8N 50 31 4 25% LI 160 Bt e mer [kl [oeerre CounsGRA Gass lnin }:lﬂl'r m:.“qm
WP Carey Sch FE- AT 3701 0% AT = I ¥ LTH] 2814
G M 107 3h ¥ Feequinemen NG1H
— i e i e T B [T F  ENG W1 OF ENG 107 3 hours, © mininen W Rtauremeni nel EMG 1 e
¢ AT 117 (A 3 s, © minimen OF ST 170 WAL 3 1,( 205
- - | NEws, C Fnifan OF MAT 251 (MAT 5 houls. C Feauinenmn] Bl MATI7D Ce am %
Advinor Heviewed St SO0 oemral ot el minimum O WAT 270 (M) 4 heurs, © Pnimn T
0 0,dea | 0 F5V 4 |58 3 hoery, C misimam X Reguremeninel FSY M1 B 1M %;n!:-ll'o
Hied : AP
- Eleckes: 1 Bout & Eeguiemsalnel ENGDEC TH A0 é:I”
Hemaniles, ans ard Design (HUL 3 haurs H - s
i e & Ragurersal sa) AREID B o
5608 oo P e OR LU 101: 1 Bear W Paguinmsni sl WET 1 A n Ei."'
m 216 WOl
10,800 ey ieemeen vt Feanen Coumeifs Gode iy [, s
0,000 =
) ENG 102 0R ENG 10 3Nt C mnimen & Faguinemen mal Ewamz E  am g::ru
o WAAT 170 [MAT 3 by, © misimumn O WAT 391 (MA} 3 o -
. hEwrs, C Furirar OB MAT 270 AT & o, & Rarpnsrrsnl sal maF1?e g a2
i B VAM:ATS manrum Sprirg
- i ]
8 — Compiaie ENG 101 OR ENG 105 DR ERG 107 W Requremenimel Es © am oM
o
. . 5 . =5 2815
“emitihiibiskishhisatiidinittioh o S
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eAdvisor Outcomes/Savings

New Graduates Student ASU recurring
Total Cost Savings Cost Savings

3,070 $24,500 per $7.3 Million 7300 S| HE
additional graduates student advising costs (advising HI%)
Ho It dditional
307082 F&+ st el e $6.5-6.9 Million 650%H~690%F ZHa| &7t
instructional costs Instructional HI%
HEEZH
SHEE0A 149 H|ES EY
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Improving our Full-Time Freshman Retention

First-Time Full-Time Freshman Retention Rate by ABOR Reporting Year (Cohort Year)

29.0%
E7.1% ET2%
a7.0% BGEM  EEOM
a7 X RY PR
RESIDENT RETENTIOM
o 87.2%
Ast 55 . 0
12% growth
33.07% Lince 2002 (TE.D%)
L —p— Resident Cohart
TOTAL RETEMTIOMN
: Total Colort
T = o= Forecast for Total 84 5%
TH.0% .
== m= Fotecast lor Resident 10% growth
0% gince 2002 (76.7%)
75.0% : : : - - - ; : : . . - - ;
ot ) o o @ & 4 R =k = £ o+ el iy -
A A - A R
"@% '.‘_:.i? ‘3,3?:-» g
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Improving Four- and Six-Year Graduation Rates

Graduation Rates: Total

74%

Veluntary Systern af Accauntability
(V5A) GRADUATION RATE

14% INCREASE

66.9%

G-YEAR GRADUATION RATE
295 INCREASE

51.B%

N 50%

4-YEAR GRADUATION RATE

= 7 —F 103% INCREASE

wtpe Gpmar grad Tate
= a-year grad rate
=50,

Cohort Year
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